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ASX Announcement 
28 July 2025 

Trigg strengthens Board with appointment of 
Antimony Expert Chris Gregory 

 
Former Rio Tinto & Mandalay executive instrumental to Costerfield’s 

success to join as a TMG Director, boosting fast tracked US 
development and downstream smelting 

 

Trigg Minerals Limited (ASX: TMG, OTCQB: TMGLF) is pleased to announce the appointment of 
Chris Gregory as Non-Executive Director, effective 28 July 2025. Mr Gregory brings more than 30 
years of global mining and leadership experience to the Board and will play a key role in fast-tracking 
development of the Antimony Canyon Project (ACP) in Utah and Trigg’s downstream antimony 
strategy in the United States. 

Mr Gregory is a highly accomplished executive with an extensive track record across mineral 
exploration, project development and corporate strategy. He has successfully led resource projects 
through discovery, development, and growth phases across a wide range of commodities and 
jurisdictions.  

Mr Gregory’s technical and leadership experience will be instrumental in advancing Trigg’s position 
as a future domestic antimony producer and downstream processor, aligning with US critical 
minerals objectives and supporting the Company's objective to restart antimony production in Utah, 
and advancing its smelter strategy. 

Mr Gregory was Vice President, Exploration and Geology at Mandalay Resources from 2009 to 
2022. He was instrumental in the success of the Costerfield Mine in Victoria, Australia’s only 
producing Antimony/Gold mine. He led the exploration team that expanded the mineral resource 
year on year and enabled continuous and profitable production from 2009 to now, with many more 
years of mine life remaining. Mr Gregory has an unparalleled knowledge of Antimony resources and 
critical minerals. Mr Gregory was also an Executive General Manager of Rio Tinto Asia. 

As part of this transition, Bishoy Habib will step down from the Trigg Board, effective immediately. 
Mr Habib has provided exceptional contributions during his tenure, and the Board thanks him for his 
ongoing support and commitment to Trigg’s success. 

Trigg Minerals’ Managing Director, Andre Booyzen, commented: “The appointment of Chris 
Gregory marks another key strategic milestone as we advance our development pathway for the 
Antimony Canyon Project. Chris brings deep technical knowledge, leadership and global perspective 
to the Board, which will help us accelerate our strategy to become a leading US-based antimony 
producer and processor. I worked with Chris for more than 8 years and welcome his guidance and 
experience to the board of Trigg. I believe he will make an immediate positive impact. 

“We also extend our thanks to Bishoy for his active contributions as a Director, he has been a 
dynamic and visionary member of the board.” 
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Mr Gregory will receive 10 million performance rights as part of his appointment, subject to 
shareholder approval. Half of the performance rights will vest upon the Company achieving a market 
capitalisation of $250 million and half will vest upon the Company announcing an Inferred Mineral 
Resource Estimate, in accordance with the JORC Code or SK-1300, at the Company’s Antimony 
Canyon Project. 
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